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GOOD PEOPLE, STRAIGHTFORWARD BANKING

Town & Country Bank

Town & Country Bank has been serving straight-
forward banking to the Las Vegas community for 
more than a decade. Four branches located in 

the West and Southwestern portions of the valley offer 
a unique and refreshing banking experience. Moreover, 
town meets country in the bank’s beautiful and intrigu-
ing architecture. 

Customers’ experience is unparalleled at Town & Coun-
try Bank because they can enjoy all the conveniences 
of a large bank with the personal touch and service that 
only comes from a friendly community bank. Direct ac-
cess to managers, loan officers and even the president 
make Town & Country Bank a standout in the banking 
industry. Professionalism and knowledge combined 
with courtesy and friendliness comprise Town & Coun-
try Bank’s hallmark customer service. 

Town & Country Bank’s synergistic approach to busi-
ness banking assists customers as they move forward 
to attain their goals. Personal bankers and officers are 
proactive in assisting customers with their financial 
health and banking needs. Town & Country Bank’s best 
practices are a win-win for clients and will be for you 
and your business as well. 

Client testimonials say it all: “Town & Country Bank has 
the best customer service.” “Town & Country Bank is 
the friendliest small bank in Nevada.” Come see for 
yourself. 

Town & Country Bank sees banking as a partnership 
that is as important to the bank as it is to clients, and 
here, they know your name. When it comes to upbeat, 
high-touch, honest, direct and sincere banking, Town & 
Country Bank is a leader. Come join in the progress with 
a beneficial banking relationship on which you can rely. n


